
Saturday March 3rd
2 - 3:15pm

Ages: 4 - 12

This event is designed to 
provide kids, between the 
ages of 4 to 12, a completely 
free experience to try youth 
hockey. 

Our top coaches will be on 
the ice to assist your child in 
learning the basics. Your son 
or daughter does not need 
any previous skating or 
hockey experience.

To Register: Call (435) 615- 
5707, visit us on the web at 
parkcityice.org,  or stop by the 
front desk. This program is 
free but you must register 24 
hours in advance.  For more 
information contact the 
Hockey Academy Director at  
615-5702 or email 
dmodrovsky@parkcity.org.

A limited amount of equip-
ment is available to borrow.   
Please allow for 30 – 40 min-
utes to get �tted and dressed 
in the hockey gear.  
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