
Total

Calculated Total: Calculated Total: Calculated Total:

$1.83 $2.93 $4,120.00

Calculated Total:
Calculated 

Total:
Calculated Total: Calculated Total: Calculated Total:

Calculated 
Total:

Calculated Total:

$107.55 $140.00 $0.50 $275.00 $275.00 $440.00 $330.00 $77,385.00 $1,316,944.85

Bid Price Given for Utility 
Adjust. Subtotal

Bid Price Given Total

$68,867.00 $1,316,944.85

Calculated Total:
Calculated 

Total:
Calculated Total: Calculated Total: Calculated Total:

Calculated 
Total:

Calculated Total:

$92.50 $211.50 $0.33 $520.00 $500.00 $1,010.00 $710.00 $162,970.00 $1,192,470.42

Bid Price Given for Utility 
Adjust. Subtotal

Bid Price Given Total

$162,970.00 $1,192,470.42

Calculated Total: Calculated Total:
Calculated 

Total:
Calculated Total: Calculated Total: Calculated Total:

Calculated 
Total:

Calculated Total: Calculated Total:

$2.14 $119.00 $200.00 $0.33 $550.00 $450.00 $900.00 $800.00 $157,650.00 $1,409,848.92 $6,125.91

Bid Price Given for Utility 
Adjust. Subtotal

Bid Price Given Total

$157,650.00 $1,443,877.00

Calculated Total: Calculated Total: Calculated Total:

$2.00 $3.00 $5,000.00

Calculated Total:
Calculated 

Total:
Calculated Total: Calculated Total: Calculated Total:

Calculated 
Total:

Calculated Total:

$91.00 $178.00 $0.37 $467.50 $358.00 $927.50 $555.00 $142,693.00 $1,174,764.88

Bid Price Given for Utility 
Adjust. Subtotal

Bid Price Given Total

$142,693.00 $1,174,764.88

Calculated Total: Calculated Total: Calculated Total:

$1.42 $1.80 $3,889.00

Calculated Total: Calculated Total:
Calculated 

Total:
Calculated Total: Calculated Total: Calculated Total:

Calculated 
Total:

Calculated Total:

$1.85 $101.00 $210.00 $0.37 $565.00 $565.00 $850.00 $625.00 $152,920.00 $1,277,677.88

Bid Price Given for Utility 
Adjust. Subtotal

Bid Price Given Total

$152,920.00 $1,277,677.88

x

Addendum?

BID OPENING – Tuesday, 5/03/2023, 10:05 AM FOR 2023 PAVEMENT MANAGEMENT

x

x

x

Calculated Total of Utility 
Adjustments:

Calculated Total of Utility 
Adjustments:

Total Utility 
Adjustments

(Per ton) (Per Square Yard) (Per ton)Company Name Bid Bond 
Received?

Bid Proposal?

Schedule A Schedule B Schedule C

Estimated Sq.Yd.: Estimated Sq.Yd.:

Raise Man Hole
Raise Water Valve and 

Monument

Schedule C 

$74,160.00

Bid Price Given Total Bid Price Given Total Bid Price Given Total

18

Schedule D
Slurry Seals (Type II) Sealcoat Trails Street Overlays Crack Seals

Street overlays Bike Path overlays Milling
Lower Man Hole

Lower Water valve and 
monument(Per ton)

Estimated Tons:

112,572 9,880 8,507 238 582,624 82 31 82 31

Estimated Tons: Estimated Tons: Estimated Sq.Ft.: Estimated Qty: Estimated Qty: Estimated Qty: Estimated Qty:

Bid Unit Price 
Given

$74,160.00

Asphalt 
Preservation x x

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

$206,006.76 $28,948.40

$206,006.76 $28,948.40

NO BID

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

$24,800.00 $110,266.38

Black Forest 
Paving x x

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Calculated Total According to Unit 
Price Given:

$914,927.85 $33,320.00 $291,312.00 $22,550.00 $8,525.00 $36,080.00

$10,230.00

$10,230.00

NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given

$914,927.85 $33,320.00 $291,312.00 $22,555.00 $8,525.00 $36,080.00

Bid Price Given Total

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Calculated Total According to Unit 
Price Given:

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Kilgore 
Contracting x x

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

$21,143.20 $1,012,333.00

$21,143.20 $1,046,361.00 $47,600.00 $192,266.00 $110,266.38$13,950.00 $73,800.00

$47,600.00

$22,010.00

NO BID
Bid Price Given Total Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given

$192,265.92 $45,100.00 $13,950.00 $73,800.00

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

NO BID NO BID NO BID

$45,100.00

Granite 
Construction 

Company
x x

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

x

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Calculated Total According to Unit 
Price Given:

$786,897.50 $50,337.00 $192,265.92 $42,640.00 $15,500.00 $82,820.00

Calculated Total of Utility 
Adjustments:

$33,010.00

NO BID
$90,000.00

Bid Price Given Total Bid Price Given Total Bid Price Given Total

Bid Unit Price 
Given

$90,000.00

Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given

$786,897.50 $50,337.00 $192,265.92 $42,640.00 $15,500.00 $88,820.00

M&M Asphalt 
Services x x

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

$225,144.00 $29,640.00

$225,144.00 $29,640.00

x

Morgan 
Pavement 

Maintenance
x x

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

x

Bid Unit Price 
Given

$159,289.38 $17,775.11

NO BID

$70,002.00

Bid Price Given Total Bid Price Given Total Bid Price Given Total

$70,002.00$159,289.38 $17,775.11

NO BID

Bid Price Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Calculated Total According to Unit 
Price Given:

$215,570.88 $38,335.00 $11,098.00 $76,055.00

Calculated Total of Utility 
Adjustments:

$17,205.00

$24,800.00

Morgan Asphalt, 
Inc. x x

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

$774,137.00 $42,364.00

$774,137.00 $42,364.00 $215,570.88 $38,335.00

x NO BID NO BID
Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given

NO BID

$18,278.00 $859,207.00 $49,980.00 $215,570.88 $46,330.00 $17,515.00 $69,700.00 $19,375.00

$19,375.00

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Price Given Bid Price Given

Calculated Total According to Unit 
Price Given:

$18,278.00 $859,207.00 $49,980.00 $215,570.88 $46,330.00 $17,515.00 $69,700.00

Calculated Total of Utility 
Adjustments:

Staker & Parson 
Companies x x

Bid Price Given Total Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given Bid Price Given

NO BID

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

Bid Unit Price 
Given

$11,098.00 $76,055.00 $17,205.00


